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ASSERTIVE COMMUNITY 
TREATMENT (ACT) 

The purpose of ACT is to provide a 
comprehensive program that's responsible 
for providing treatment, rehabilitation, and 
support services to individuals with severe 
and persistent mental illnesses. Those 
individuals receiving ACT services may be 
experiencing conditions typical of diagnoses 
such as schizophrenia, bipolar disorder and 
other serious mental illnesses and who have 
experienced multiple psychiatric hospital 
admissions either at the state or community 
level. 

 

FAMILY SERVICES 
 

Family services are intended to help 
children/youth, and their family and/or 
caregivers by preventing additional crisis 
situations. We will improve and maintain 
stable relationships by providing support 
services for children/youth receiving 
individual services and/or assisting in 
accessing appropriate community-based 
services. 

INDIVIDUAL SERVICES 
 

Our services are for individuals three years 
and older. These services are intended to 
meet the needs of those experiencing 
behavioral and/or emotional issues. Their 
functioning may be impaired and disruptive 
to family relationships, daycare, school, work 
and/or their community. For children, our 
focus is placed on the parental or caregiver 
relationship by helping the individual to 
improve coping skills and to provide support 
by improving the individual’s behavior 
management skills through a team 
approach. 

 
 
  
CRISIS INTERVENTION 

 
Services are intended to resolve the current 
crisis, avoid a more intense or higher level 
of care, and prevent a future crisis. This 
may include attempts or threats of suicide, 
harm to others or self, a first-time acute or 
reoccurring rapid onset of emotional, 
behavioral, psychiatric, or substance abuse 
symptoms. 
 

MEDICATION MANAGEMENT 
 

Medication Management is intended to meet 
the needs of the individuals whose only 
needs are monitoring and support in 
managing of medications. The service is for 
individuals without ongoing treatment needs 
outside of medication-related services. 
However, there may be times when case 
management services are needed for 
additional support to ensure medical needs 
are met. These services are primarily 
provided at an office- based locations. 
However, services may also be provided at 
school, in the community, or via 
telemedicine. 

 
   TRANSITIONAL SERVICES 
 

The major focus here is to provide flexible 
services that assist individuals in maintaining 
stability, prevention of further crisis and 
ensuring those individuals receive the 
appropriate level of care. This service is highly 
individualized, so the level of service intensity 
and length of stay is expected to vary 
depending on the individual’s need. This  
service is available for up to 90 days. 
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